
 SIXTH RACE - INDIANA Today's Racing Digest 

 

 

Distance: 1 Mile 70 Yards Race Level: Base 170 Race Cond: STK Gr   

Conditions: Lady Fog Horn H. FOR FILLIES THREE YEARS OLD REGISTERED 

INDIANA BRED SIRED BY REGISTERED INDIANA STALLIONS. No 
nomination fee, $300 to pass the entry box and an additional $300 to 
start, with $200,000 Guaranteed.  Supplementary nominations may 
be made at the usual time of closing of entries for a fee $1,500 which  
includes entry and starting fees.  After paying 1% to owners of horses 

finishing sixth through last, the remaining purse will be divided 60% to the 
winner, 20% to second, 11% to third, 6% to fourth, and 3% to fifth.  Weights: 
Friday, October 18.  Starters to be named through the entry box by the usual 
time of closing.  This race will be limited to 12 starters.  Should more than 12 
horses pass the entry box, preference will be given to (1) High Weights (Scale 
ofweights considered) (2) Highest lifetime earnings will be used in determining 
the order of preference of horses assigned equal weights.  The entry fee will be 
refunded if a horse fails to draw into the race. Closed Friday, October 11, 2024, 
with 16 Nominaations. 

Purse: $200,000 

AFTL: 24.1, 47.8, 1:12.9 and 1:42.6 

Favorites: 33.3% Win; 63.6% in-the-money 

Track Profile: 11 races F=45.5% P=27.3% M=9.1% R=18.2% 
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SPEED & PACE FORECASTS RACE COMPETITION LEVELS (RCL) FINAL TIIME RATING   

 
AG       FST FNL   

  
BST BST PST AVG LST BST BST BST HANDICAPPING 

HORSE SX EQU FIR CPR FIG RAT PER RRL RCL SUR DST CLS RCL RAT RAT SUR DST      FACTORS      

Touchdown Pass 3f 
 

73 102 115 104 R 160 X 115 115 100 100 104 104 104 104 13,10c,8 

Charming Jazel 3f 
 

82 109 110 116 P 110 110 110 110 110 99 116 116 116 116 13,16b,10c,31 

The Kid Pataky 3f   79 103 X 116 F 145 135 135 X 135 124 X 117 117 X 16b,10c,31 

Solrun 3f B 87 128 122 125 R 160 160 160 160 160 105 125 125 125 125 13,10c,4a 

Werk It Wendy 3f 
 

76 115 112 119 F 115 115 120 115 120 107 119 128 128 119 13,16b,10c,31 

Classic Kitten 3f B 72 98 105 102 M 110 110 115 115 110 105 102 102 102 102 13,16b,10c,4a,30 

Jolly Justice 3f   81 113 119 116 M 160 100 160 160 100 94 116 116 116 116 13,10c,29 

Martz Rosey 3f 
 

67 96 105 104 P 120 X 100 100 100 100 95 107 104 104 16b,10c 

Crosley 3f   93 132 125 135 P 160 160 160 160 160 140 135 135 135 135 13,10c 

Rafaella 3f B 67 68 109 86 P 125 X 125 115 100 116 84 107 102 102 13,10c,4a,29 

 
FRACTIONAL CHART ORDER OF FINISH AND AVERAGE TIMES 

   (This is not a Selection) 

1:  Crosley ET: 24.2,49.0,1:13.8 and 1:43.6 
2:  Solrun AT: 24.1,47.8,1:12.9 and 1:42.6 (Average Times for mid-level races) 
3:  Werk it Wendy AFTL: 24.1,47.8,1:12.9 and 1:42.6 (Average Times for this level) 

NEW Easier to Use Race Header Now Includes: Speed and Pace Figures with Fast Figs, Race Class Rating angles Final Time Ratings from multiple angles. 

Top figure is highlighted in each column. New Handicapping Factors for the last start:  26a,b,c (Key Race), 27 (Off Track), 28 (Trouble), 29 (Tired), 30 (No 

Factor)  31 (Strong Finish), 32 (Won Easily) and today’s race: 13 a b (Lasix).  We’ll be adding more HF’s in the coming months and please see the inside back 

cover for a full description of each figure and how to use the new Race Header. 

             LAST START TRIP NOTES 
  
Touchdown Pass unrushed between foes,angled4p1/4,lacked late bid 
Charming Jazel stalked4path,bid5/16,drew off,kept to task 
Solrun unrushed inside,bid1/4,shifted3path3/16,gained place late 
Werk It Wendy broke outward,clear,led inside,drew off stretch,steady 
drive 

Classic Kitten stalked inside,angled5wide5/16,rallied stretch,no threat 
Jolly Justice unrushed4path,angled inside3/16,no late bid 
Martz Rosey saved ground to no avail 
Crosley stalked3p,bid5/16,drew off,strong hand ride 
Rafaella bore out start,inside,angled3path turn,no bid

 
 Touchdown Pass   ( M.Elliott/F.De La Cruz = 45  6-8-5 ) 

3F - Pass Rush(13%T,9%S,14%M) - Nora's Song by War Chant 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (13.3%) 15 2-0-3  DIRT RTE: (16.7%) 36 6-2-8 
UP: (6.3%) 80 5-9-7   

 LAST 10 FIRE:      73, 64, 26, 60, 60, 45, 35, 46, 44 

WORKS:  

NOTES: angld4p1/4,no bid 10/2/24 reared st,back3,rushed 8/15/24  
through early,eased 7/31/24 drew off,mild urging 6/17/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  4 1-0-1 ALL DIRT ROUTES  4 1-0-1 

  DIST/ POS/FLD  TRNR TK TRK RACE RACE   FIN POS/ MORN ACTL TRK  Pos1  Pos2  Pos3  Pos4   Today's LST PAC FNL LxClm 
TRK DATE&RACE SURF WINNERS WGT JCKY CD BIAS TYPE CONDITIONS RCL CPR BTN LNGH LINE ODDS VAR  1ST  2ND  3RD  4TH  FINAL FRT RAT RAT EQUIP 

IND 10/2/24-4 1M70  7/9 -0 120 M.Elt/Y.Crz FT NONE STK $100K R160  C102 6-10.25 ML12 A10 -4   8-24.8   8-50.2   8-1:15.0   8-1:41.2 1:45.7 30.7 108 104 L 
IND 8/15/24-2 1 1/16  4/6 -0 111 M.Elt/J.Rmo FT NONE ALW NW2-X-S R115  C79 3-13.75 X A5.9  0   1-26.4   1-51.4   3-1:16.0   3-1:42.1 1:47.6 31.6  69 75 L 
IND 7/31/24-9 1M70  4/12-2 120 M.Elt/R.Pet FT NONE STK $200K R120  C1 10-29.50 X A54 +15   9-24.7 10-49.1 10-1:15.6 10-1:44.4 1:51.2 35.6 101 21 L 
IND 6/17/24-5 1T  3/7 -0 120 M.Elt/Y.Crz FM NONE ALW NW1-X-S R100  C80 1-3.00 X A2.6 +13   1-24.0   1-48.3   1-1:14.4  1:46.1« 31.7 129 98 L 
IND 6/6/24-4 1M70  2/6 -3 120 M.Elt/Y.Crz FT NONE MSW S R85  C74 1-0.50 X A36 +11   1-24.6   1-49.9   1-1:15.8   1-1:41.7 1:46.7 30.9  99 89 L 
IND 4/8/24-2 5 1/2  9/12-4 121 M.Elt/Y.Crz FT NONE MSW S R85  C34 8-21.00 X A95 +4 10-23.3 10-48.1   9-  :59.8  1:16.4 28.3  98 51 L 
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 Charming Jazel   ( R.Gorham/E.Perez = 103  12-9-10 ) 

3F - Charming Kitten(10%T,0%S,25%M) - Pampered Vow by Broken Vow 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (6.7%) 15 1-4-2  DIRT RTE: (20.4%) 98 20-19-15 
30+: (14.3%) 419 60-69-74  UP: (14.6%) 206 30-37-33 
  LAST 10 FIRE:      82, 58, 32, 49, 50, 62, 58, 50 

WORKS: IND Oct 18    :50.0b ft (14/23) 

NOTES: 4p,bid5/16,kept to tsk 9/24/24 stlk rail,late rally3p 9/4/24 stlk  
5p,faded far turn 7/6/24 stalked rail,no bid 5/28/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  2 2-0-0 ALL DIRT ROUTES  2 2-0-0 

IND 9/24/24-8 1M70  6/7 -0 117 R.Grm/E.Prz GD NONE ALW NW1-X-S R110  C109 1-4.50 ML9/2 A4.3 +2   3-25.1   3-49.6   2-1:14.6   1-1:40.5 1:44.9 30.3 110 116 L 
IND 9/4/24-5 1 1/16T  2/9 -1 118 R.Grm/E.Prz FM NONE ALW NW1-X-S R100  C75 2-0.25 X A16 +17   3-25.0   5-49.8   5-1:16.1   3-1:42.3 1:46.6« 30.5  89 90 L 
IND 7/6/24-9 1T 10/12-1 120 R.Grm/E.Prz GD NONE STK $100K R120  C42 10-18.40 X A80 +11   9-25.1   7-49.7 10-1:16.4  1:49.0« 32.6  83 54 L 
IND 5/28/24-8 1 1/16T  2/9 -1 120 R.Grm/A.Brs GD NONE ALW NW2-L-S R100  C72 3-5.50 X A5.6 -2   3-25.0   4-50.6   4-1:16.7   4-1:43.8 1:47.7« 31.0  80 74 L 
IND 5/9/24-4 1M70  7/7 -0 120 R.Grm/A.Brs FT NONE MSW S R85  C69 2/1-1.75 ML8 A1.9 +10   3-24.4   3-49.4   2-1:16.0   2-1:42.6 1:47.5 31.5  99 77 L 
IND 4/8/24-2 5 1/2  4/12-4 121 R.Grm/E.Prz FT NONE MSW S R85  C77 6-9.50 X A10 +4   6-22.9   6-47.4   7-  :59.1  1:14.1 26.7 114 86 L 
 
 The Kid Pataky   ( A.Cunningham/S.Bermudez = 21  4-3-4 ) 

3F - Pataky Kid(23%T,50%S,25%M) - Zappita by Ghostzapper 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (20.0%) 15 3-2-2  DIRT RTE: (7.7%) 13 1-1-4 
S/R: (13.3%) 15 2-0-2  Lasix: (12.1%) 33 4-2-4 
30+: (7.5%) 347 26-40-37  UP: (17.4%) 23 4-3-1 
 

 LAST 10 FIRE:      DNF, 79, 77, 70, 74, 61, 67, 72, 49, 52 

WORKS:  

NOTES: bore out1/4,hest,rally 9/25/24 awk,duel,vied,caught 9/4/24  
clear,dueled,driving 7/17/24 awk st,inside,driving 6/24/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  0 0-0-0 ALL DIRT ROUTES  0 0-0-0 

IND 9/25/24-6 5 1/2  3/9 -0 122 A.Cnm/S.Brz    NONE HCP S R145  X  DNF ML12 X    X X X X DNF    0    
IND 9/4/24-3 6F  2/7 -1 116 A.Cnm/S.Brz FT NONE AOC 40 NW2$-X R135  C103 2-0.25 X A3.2  0   1-22.3   2-45.4   3-  :58.1  1:12.1 26.7 153 116 LbF 
IND 7/17/24-8 5F  4/7 -1 117 A.Cnm/S.Brz GD NONE ALW  NW1$-X R120  C102 1-0.50 X A5.0 +6   1-22.6   1-45.5   1:12.0 26.5 147 117 Lb 
IND 6/24/24-4 6F  2/6 -1 118 A.Cnm/S.Brz FT NONE ALW NW2-X-S R115  C93 1-1.25 X A1.9 +5   1-22.5   1-46.7   1-  :59.7  1:12.9 26.2 131 104 LbF 
IND 6/6/24-6 5 1/2  1/11-2 118 A.Cnm/S.Brz FT NONE ALW NW3-L-X-S R125  C95 2-0.75 X A2.7 -1   1-22.7   1-45.7   2-  :58.5  1:12.5 26.8 143 110 LbF 
IND 5/22/24-7 5 1/2  7/11-3 122 A.Cnm/S.Brz FT NONE STK $100K R120  C62 7-9.60 X A5.9  0   1-22.0   1-46.1   5-1:00.2  1:14.4 28.3 147 81 bF 
 
 Solrun   ( B.Michael/A.Calleja = 1  0-0-0 ) 

3F - Holiday Promise(23%T,18%S,20%M) - Nice Dreams by Strong Hope 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (13.3%) 15 2-1-1  DIRT RTE: (6.7%) 15 1-4-1 
UP: (5.6%) 18 1-3-1   

 LAST 10 FIRE:      87, 52, 64, 65, 60, 36, 58, 1, 43, 40 

WORKS: TTC Oct 19    :38.4b ft (17/24) TTC Sep 21    :49.8b ft (23/46) 

NOTES: bid1/4,shift3p3/16 10/2/24 brk in,stalk3p to str 9/6/24  
4p,rally5p3/8,driving 8/13/24 bmp st,4p,bid1/2,rally 7/3/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  7 0-3-0 ALL DIRT ROUTES  7 0-3-0 

IND 10/2/24-4 1M70  2/9 -0 120 B.Mcl/R.Pet FT NONE STK $100K R160  C128 2-3.25 ML3 A8.9 -4   9-24.9   9-50.3   7-1:14.8   3-1:40.0 1:44.3 29.5 110 125 Lb 
IND 9/6/24-1 1M  4/5 -0 120 B.Mcl/S.Brz FT NONE ALW NW2-X-S R115  C67 4-13.00 ML6 A13 -2   4-25.5   3-49.3   4-1:15.0   4-1:41.5 1:47.3 32.3  98 80 Lb 
IND 8/13/24-9 1T  6/10-1 119 B.Mcl/R.Pet FM NONE ALW NW1-X-S R100  C91 1-2.75 X A4.6 +18   9-25.9   9-49.9   5-1:16.0  1:46.0« 30.0  77 99 Lb 
IND 7/3/24-5 7 1/2T  2/6 -2 120 B.Mcl/R.Pet FM NONE MSW S R85  C84 1-2.25 X A1.4 -5   6-26.4   5-50.6   1-1:15.2  1:46.4« 31.2  81 93 Lb 
IND 6/6/24-4 1M70  5/6 -3 120 B.Mcl/R.Pet FT NONE MSW S R85  C72 2-0.50 X A11 +11   2-24.7   2-50.0   2-1:15.8   2-1:41.7 1:46.8 31.0  98 87 Lb 
IND 5/9/24-4 1M70  3/7 -0 120 B.Mcl/R.Pet FT NONE MSW S R85  C39 4-10.75 ML30 A4.8 +10   7-25.3   7-50.0   6-1:16.6   4-1:43.6 1:49.3 32.7  77 50 Lb 
 
 Werk It Wendy   ( R.Dobbs, Jr./R.Prescott = 49  7-14-6 ) 

3F - Greeley's Conquest(7%T,10%S,13%M) - Kitty's Charge by Exchange Rate 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (0.0%) 15 0-5-1  DIRT RTE: (11.8%) 34 4-11-3 
30+: (16.5%) 97 16-20-11  UP: (11.8%) 51 6-15-6 
  LAST 10 FIRE:      76, 75, 86, 72, 74, 74 

WORKS: IND Oct  1     :49.4b my (16/21) 

NOTES: rail,steady drive 9/6/24 5p,bid3/8,2nd best 8/6/24 rail,drew  
off,rddn out 6/25/24 duel,chkd1/8,gave way 5/22/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  1 1-0-0 ALL DIRT ROUTES  1 1-0-0 

IND 9/6/24-1 1M  2/5 -0 119 R.Db./R.Pet FT NONE ALW NW2-X-S R115  C115 1-1.25 ML2/5 A0.0 -2   1-25.0   1-49.0   1-1:14.6   1-1:40.4 1:44.7 30.1 111 119 L 
IND 8/6/24-5 6F  5/9 -1 119 R.Db./R.Pet FT NONE ALW NW2-X-S R115  C98 2-6.00 X A0.6 +7   6-22.6   5-45.9   2-  :58.4  1:12.4 26.5 141 111 L 
IND 6/25/24-4 6F  2/7 -0 119 R.Db./R.Pet FT NONE ALW NW1-X-S R100  C121 1-9.75 X A0.7 +3   1-22.2   1-45.8   1-  :58.3  1:11.3 25.5 149 128 L 
IND 5/22/24-7 5 1/2  4/11-3 120 R.Db./R.Pet FT NONE STK $100K R120  C92 4/3-2.10 X A1.2  0   2-22.0   2-46.1   2-  :59.1  1:12.9 26.8 147 104 L 
IND 5/4/24-2 6F  3/7 -1 121 R.Db./R.Pet FT NONE MSW S R85  C101 1-8.50 X A0.9 +5   2-22.6   1-46.7   1-  :59.5  1:12.4 25.7 129 111 L 
IND 4/8/24-2 5 1/2  1/12-4 121 R.Db./O.Mja FT NONE MSW S R85  C101 3-1.75 X A1.7 +4 11-23.4   4-46.6   3-  :58.6  1:12.6 26.0 119 108 L 
 
 Classic Kitten   ( J.Davis/S.Sanjur = 9  1-2-3 ) 

3F - Charming Kitten(10%T,0%S,25%M) - Klassie Connect by Proud Citizen 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (0.0%) 15 0-3-3  DIRT RTE: (9.1%) 33 3-3-5 
30+: (12.4%) 97 12-12-16  UP: (11.3%) 71 8-9-11 
 

 LAST 10 FIRE:      72, 44, 64, 47, 42, 61, 61, 40, 50, 37 

WORKS: IND Oct 18  1:04.6b ft (3/4) IND Oct  8   1:01.6b ft (2/2) 

 IND Sep 17  1:03.8b ft (4/5) 

NOTES: angld5w5/16,rallied 9/24/24 bmp,press3p,faded str 8/13/24  
press,bid1/4,driving 7/18/24 lacked late bid 6/4/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  7 2-2-1 ALL DIRT ROUTES  9 4-2-1 

IND 9/24/24-8 1M70  2/7 -0 117 J.Dvs/S.Snr GD NONE ALW NW1-X-S R110  C98 2-4.50 ML15 A3.8 +2   5-25.2   5-49.9   6-1:15.3   2-1:40.8 1:45.8 30.5  98 102 Lb 
IND 8/13/24-9 1T 10/10-1 117 J.Dvs/F.D z FM NONE ALW NW1-X-S R100  C49 5-8.25 X A11 +18   3-24.5   3-48.7   2-1:15.2  1:47.7« 32.5 110 74 Lb 
IND 7/18/24-2 1M  6/7 -0 117 J.Dvs/S.Snr FT NONE CLM 15 NW2-L-S R100  C104 1-2.00 X A2.1  0   2-25.0   2-49.9   2-1:16.1   1-1:42.2 1:45.9 29.8  89 101 Lb 
IND 6/4/24-5 1 1/16T  8/10-3 118 J.Dvs/A.Jmz FM NONE ALW NW2-L-X-S R115  C57 9-12.50 X A15 +18   8-25.6   8-49.6   9-1:16.0   9-1:42.8 1:47.9« 31.9  81 71 L 
IND 5/14/24-3 1M70  4/7 -0 118 J.Dvs/A.Jmz SY NONE ALW NW2-L-X-S R115  C52 5-19.25 ML15 A2.8 +4   3-24.2   5-48.7   6-1:15.4   6-1:42.8 1:48.8 33.4 113 60 L 
IND 5/1/24-3 1M  3/7 -0 118 J.Dvs/A.Jmz FT NONE ALW NW2-L-S R100  C94 2-1.50 X A13 -4   4-25.0   4-49.5   4-1:15.4   3-1:41.9 1:46.1 30.7  99 98 L 
 
 Jolly Justice   ( R.Klopp/E.Roman = 107  23-18-11 ) 

3F - Harry's Holiday(21%T,5%S,15%M) - Bank Candy by Banker's Gold 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (13.3%) 15 2-3-2  DIRT RTE: (9.5%) 63 6-12-11 
UP: (16.9%) 124 21-15-16   

 LAST 10 FIRE:      81, 58, 64, 55, 33, 51, 45, 34 

WORKS:  

NOTES: 4p,angld in3/16,no bid 10/2/24 duel str,up late,drvg 9/4/24  
2p,drew off,mild drive 8/19/24 stlk3p,rally5p3/16 7/29/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  1 0-0-0 ALL DIRT ROUTES  1 0-0-0 

IND 10/2/24-4 1M70  9/9 -0 120 R.Kop/E.Rmn FT NONE STK $100K R160  C113 5-6.50 ML10 A12 -4   6-24.6   6-49.9   6-1:14.5   5-1:40.4 1:44.9 30.4 119 116 L 
IND 9/4/24-5 1 1/16T  5/9 -1 120 R.Kop/E.Rmn FM NONE ALW NW1-X-S R100  C75 1-0.25 X A10 +17   2-24.8   2-49.5   2-1:15.9   2-1:42.0 1:46.5« 30.6  95 92 L 
IND 8/19/24-6 1 1/16T  3/9 -2 120 R.Kop/E.Rmn GD NONE MSW S R85  C86 1-4.00 X A1.1 +12   1-23.8   1-47.9   1-1:14.3   1-1:41.3 1:45.9« 31.6 134 101 L 
IND 7/29/24-3 1T  5/6 -1 120 R.Kop/E.Rmn FM NONE MSW S R75  C88 2-1.00 X A8.6 +5   5-24.8   5-50.5   6-1:16.8  1:46.9« 30.1  81 86 L 
IND 7/9/24-6 6F  3/10-1 120 R.Kop/E.Rmn MY NONE MCL 15-S R80  C19 5-15.25 X A32 +2   8-23.6   9-48.9   8-1:02.9  1:16.8 27.9  81 45 L 
IND 6/17/24-3 5 1/2  3/6 -0 120 R.Kop/E.Rmn FT NONE MCL 15-S R80  C44 4-7.00 X A5.0 -1   5-23.5   5-48.8   5-1:02.1  1:15.5 26.7  84 65 L 
 



 SIXTH RACE - INDIANA Today's Racing Digest 
 Martz Rosey   ( T.Medina/O.Villarreal = 4  1-1-0 ) 

3F - Slope(0%T,0%S,14%M) - Vicary Rose by Vicar 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (33.3%) 15 5-1-1  DIRT RTE: (18.2%) 33 6-4-5 
S/R: (16.3%) 43 7-4-4  30+: (17.5%) 40 7-4-5 
UP: (8.5%) 59 5-3-12    LAST 10 FIRE:      67, 67, 36, 56, 47, 47, 41, 29, 59, 70 

WORKS: IND Oct 18    :51.2b ft (19/23) 

NOTES: saved ground 9/16/24 4p,bid5/16,kept to tsk 9/5/24 stalked  
rail,faded5/16 8/13/24 trailed,bid3p1/4,faltr 7/18/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  5 2-0-0 ALL DIRT ROUTES  6 2-0-0 

IND 9/16/24-3 5 1/2  3/8 -1 113 T.Mda/A.Cla FT NONE CLM 15 -C-S R120  C83 6-6.00 X A7.9  0   8-23.7   7-47.6   7-1:00.0  1:13.5 25.9  99 95 F 
IND 9/5/24-1 1M  3/7 -1 110 T.Mda/J.Rmo FT NONE CLM 15 NW2-L-S R100  C96 1-8.50 X A3.1 -4   4-25.6   4-50.1   2-1:15.6   1-1:41.6 1:45.7 30.1  87 104 F 
IND 8/13/24-9 1T  1/10-1 118 T.Mda/M.Adn FM NONE ALW NW1-X-S R100  C52 10-10.85 X A31 +18   4-24.7   4-49.3   6-1:16.5  1:48.2« 31.7  87 66   
IND 7/18/24-2 1M  7/7 -0 118 T.Mda/M.Adn FT NONE CLM 15 NW2-L-S R100  C91 4-4.75 X A11  0   7-25.4   7-50.7   5-1:16.8   4-1:43.0 1:46.9 30.1  72 86 F 
IND 7/10/24-7 6F  6/11-2 118 T.Mda/M.Adn FT NONE CLM 15 NW2-L-S R100  C47 6-9.05 X A29 +8   8-23.6   8-48.3   7-1:01.1  1:15.2 26.9  90 69 bF 
IND 6/12/24-4 6F  8/8 -2 118 T.Mda/A.Ula FT NONE ALW NW2-L-S R100  C41 6-17.50 X A35 +4   4-22.8   4-46.8   6-1:00.6  1:15.7 28.9 125 62 bF 
 
 Crosley   ( J.Langemeier/M.Pedroza, Jr. = 8  4-0-1 ) 

3F - Pass Rush(13%T,9%S,14%M) - Amberly Village by Flatter 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (13.3%) 15 2-1-2  DIRT RTE: (20.0%) 10 2-2-1 
2nd 90+: (7.7%) 13 1-1-3  UP: (20.0%) 15 3-2-1 
 

 LAST 10 FIRE:      93, 75, 78 

WORKS: TTC Oct 17    :48.2b ft (1/18) TTC Sep 21    :48.8b ft (9/46) 

 TTC Sep 14    :36.2b ft (3/10) 

NOTES: 3p,bid5/16,driving 10/2/24 awk,4p,bid3/8,came in 5/22/24  
inside,lasted,drvg 4/8/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  1 1-0-0 ALL DIRT ROUTES  1 1-0-0 

IND 10/2/24-4 1M70  3/9 -0 118 J.Lnr/E.Mrs FT NONE STK $100K R160  C132 1-3.25 ML8/5 A0.3 -4   2-24.2   2-49.3   2-1:13.8   1-1:39.3 1:43.6 29.8 135 135 L 
IND 5/22/24-7 5 1/2 11/11-3 120 J.Lnr/E.Mrs FT NONE STK $100K R120  C103 1/5-1.50 X A5.4  0   4-22.4   4-46.4   1-  :58.9  1:12.5 26.1 137 110 L 
IND 4/8/24-2 5 1/2  2/12-4 121 J.Lnr/E.Mrs FT NONE MSW S R85  C104 1-0.25 X A7.3 +4   1-22.0   1-45.9   1-  :58.5  1:12.2 26.3 150 114 L 
 
 
 Rafaella   ( M.Elliott/H.Leahey = 6  0-1-0 ) 

3F - Taprize(0%T,0%S,5%M) - Crossed by Anthony's Cross 

TRAINER STATS: 
LAST 15: (13.3%) 15 2-0-3  DIRT RTE: (16.7%) 36 6-2-8 
S/R: (7.5%) 80 6-8-10  UP: (6.3%) 80 5-9-7 
  LAST 10 FIRE:      58, 67, 56, 58, 64, 62, 67, 56, 70, 69 

WORKS: IND Sep 21  1:04.0b ft (15/18) 

NOTES: awk,angld3p trn,no bid 10/14/24 stalked4p,faded1/4 10/2/24  
press2p,gave way str 9/6/24 3path,faded 8/15/24 

IND DIRT ROUTES  5 1-1-1 ALL DIRT ROUTES  5 1-1-1 

IND 10/14/24-3 6F  2/7 -0 118 M.Elt/F.D z FT NONE ALW NW2-X-S R125  C69 4-13.25 X A18  0   4-23.3   5-47.0   5-1:00.4  1:14.2 27.2 114 84 Lb 
IND 10/2/24-4 1M70  6/9 -0 120 M.Elt/F.D z FT NONE STK $100K R160  C68 8-16.50 ML6 A8.9 -4   3-24.3   3-49.4   3-1:14.0   7-1:41.1 1:46.9 32.9 131 86 Lb 
IND 9/6/24-1 1M  5/5 -0 118 M.Elt/F.D z FT NONE ALW NW2-X-S R115  C74 3-10.25 ML20 A32 -2   2-25.3   2-49.1   2-1:14.7   3-1:41.2 1:46.8 32.1 105 87 Lb 
IND 8/15/24-2 1 1/16  3/6 -0 118 M.Elt/F.D z FT NONE ALW NW2-X-S R115  C66 5-19.00 X A7.0  0   6-27.2   6-52.1   4-1:16.7   5-1:43.0 1:48.6 31.9  47 60 Lb 
IND 6/6/24-6 5 1/2  8/11-2 118 M.Elt/F.D z FT NONE ALW NW3-L-X-S R125  C77 5-7.00 X A11 -1 10-24.2 10-47.5   8-1:00.2  1:13.7 26.2  93 92 Lb 
IND 5/22/24-7 5 1/2  5/11-3 122 M.Elt/F.D z FT NONE STK $100K R120  C76 6-8.10 X A18  0   7-23.3   7-47.5   7-1:00.6  1:14.1 26.6 107 86 Lb 
 
 

 

YOUR HORSES TO FOLLOW LIST – Create your own! 
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Your PICK 3 – PICK 4 – PICK 5 Selections 

LEG 1      

LEG 2      

LEG 3      

LEG 4      

LEG 5      

 

 
 


