
Jarrod’s BC Friday Full Card Highlights for 11-3-23 
SA 2 GRAND SLAM SMILE ($7.80) 

SA 7 HARD TO JUSTIFY ($20.20), Trifecta ($411.00) 
Double (races 6-7, $90.20) 
Pick 3 (races 5-7, $753.80) 

Double (races 7-8, $489.80) 
Pick 3 (races 6-8, $2,464.20) 

SA 9 UNQUESTIONABLE (SA Best Bet #3, 
$5.00), Trifecta ($407.40), Superfecta ($3,415.20) 

Double (races 8-9, $132.20) 
Pick 3 (races 7-9, $1,605.40) 

$3 BC Turf Pick 3 (races 5, 7, 9) - $334.50 
SA 10 Hejazi/Ghost of Midnight Exacta ($14.60) 

Double (races 9-10, $12.20) 
Pick 3 (races 8-10, $389.80) 



BREEDERS’ CUP Full Card From SANTA ANITA for 
Friday (11-3-23)
By Jarrod Horak (therunawayhorse.com, 
todaysracingdigest.com)
SA Weather: Partly Cloudy. High 82. SA Best Bets (1, 8, 
9) 

BC Bet Minimums
$3.00: All-Turf Pick 3
$2.00: Win, Place, Show, Daily Double
$1.00: Exacta, Super High 5, Pick 6, Special Daily Double
$0.50: Trifecta, Pick 3, Pick 4, Pick 5, All-Dirt Pick 4, All-
Turf Pick 4
$0.10: Superfecta

BC Friday Full Card Analysis & Wagering Strategies

SA 1 (Golden Mile, 8T) - SA Best Bet
Primary - #5 GO WITH GUSTO, #6 Mo Fox Givin
Secondary - #4 Ultra Power, #8 Asean
Wagers: #5 to win, Exacta 5/4-6-8, Exacta 4-6-8/5, 
Trifecta key 5/4-6-8, Superfecta 5-6/5-6/4-8/4-8

50 cent Pick 5 (races 1-5): 5-6/5-7/2-4/10-11/1-2 ($16)
50 cent Pick 5 (races 1-5): 5/5-6-7-11/2-3-4-12/1-10/2-4 
($32)

Comments: #5 Go With Gusto (5-2) is a $225k maiden 
for Mark Casse. She rallied from off the pace and crossed 
the line 1st in her 8T bow at WO, but she was placed 5th 
through disqualification. She rallied for the show in the G1 
Summer Sept. 16 and runner-up My Boy Prince was a 

http://therunawayhorse.com/
http://todaysracingdigest.com/


next-out stakes winner in the Cup and Saucer. Rosario 
takes the call and she figures to make a run in the stretch. 
She got the best TRD Final Time Rating in the Summer. 
#6 Mo Fox Givin (6-1) stalked the pace and kicked away 
to win by 3 3/4 lengths in her turf route bow at Colonial 
Downs and was 49-1 that day. She rallied to miss by a 
head in a NW2L allowance turf route at CD second time 
out. Powell is her new trainer and Prat takes the call, and 
she will try to get involved from off the pace. She earned 
an improved speed rating second time out. #4 Ultra 
Power (3-1) chased wide and retreated to last in his 
disappointing dirt sprint bow Aug. 25. He was the favorite 
in an extended sprint at LRC second time out and he 
pressed inside and pulled clear, and the show finisher was 
a next-out winner. Dettori hops aboard the Curlin colt and 
he should impact the pace. Baffert is strong with his first 
route starters but is just 3% first turf (34-race sample). 
Unique Bella is the dam and she was a multiple G1 winner 
on dirt. #8 Asean (4-1) ran well in multiple 5T races on 
good ground in Ireland. She misfired twice including a 10th 
of 13 in a Group 3 in Great Britain Oct. 13, and both below 
par efforts were on soft ground. She should like the SoCal 
firm footing and has route influences on the dam side of 
her pedigree. 

SA 2 (Golden State Juvenile Fillies, CA-bred, 7f)
Primary - #7 GRAND SLAM SMILE, #5 Mirinda
Secondary - #6 Dancingthruparis, #11 Crazy Hot
Wagers: #7 to win, Exacta 6-7-11/5, Trifecta key 
7/5-6-11, Superfecta 5-7/5-7/6-11/6-11

50 cent Pick 4 (races 2-5): 7/2-3-4-12/1-10-11-12/1-2-4-9 



($32) 
50 cent Pick 4 (races 2-5): 5-7/2-4/1-10-11-12/1-2 ($16)

Comments: #7 Grand Slam Smile (5-2) drew a 
comfortable post and might be in the right stalking spot. 
She wired the field in her all-weather sprint bow, stalked 
and scored in the Fasig-Tipton Debutante second time 
out, and stalked and was clearly second best in the CTBA 
last time. The fresh Smiling Tiger filly drilled a 5f gate 
bullet for this at GG on Oct. 23. #5 Mirinda (8-5) was the 
even money favorite in her bow and she set the pace and 
kicked away to score by 6 1/2 lengths. The $190k Mitole 
filly should be all over the pace but there was not much 
behind her in her DMR bow and she meets other speed in 
a tougher spot. Mike Smith stays put and Gary Mandella 
struggles with this type of short layoff runner. She is faster 
than these based on her debut speed rating. #6 
Prancingthruparis (8-1) dueled and scored by a half-
length in her 5T bow Aug. 11. She switched to dirt, stalked 
the pace, and was clearly second best in the Generous 
Portion second time out. She improved last time and will 
have to run faster to win this. Fresu stays put and he wins 
races with Eurton, and her stalking style should play well 
in this spot. #11 Crazy Hot (5-1) exits a wire-to-wire 
stakes victory in the Generous Portion under Smith, but he 
opted to ride Mirinda in this spot. She wired the field in her 
local bow and chased the pace and hit the board in back-
to-back stakes races on June 17 and Aug. 6. She earned 
her best number yet last time and she drew outside the 
other speed. Johnny V is her new pilot.  

SA 3 (Senator Ken Maddy, 6.5T hillside)



Primary - #4 ELM DRIVE, #2 White Moonlight
Secondary - #12 Playlist, #3 Honey Pants, #13 Rose 
Maddox, #6 Unbridled Mary
Wagers: #4 to win, Exacta box 2-4, Trifecta 
2-4-12/2-3-4-6-12-13/3-6-13

Comments: #4 Elm Drive (6-1) was pre-entered in the BC 
F&M Sprint but that race was too tough for her and she 
ends up here instead. She wired the field in the local 
Mizdirection May 20 and was able to get out there and 
control the pace that day. She also won the G3 Monrovia 
(off the turf) and placed in the G2 Great Lady M. and G1 
Clement L. Hirsch. She was a fading 4th in the G3 
Chillingworth Sept. 29 and might move forward under her 
new rider Prat in her second start after a short layoff. #2 
White Moonlight (3-1) won a pair of extended sprints in 
Great Britain earlier this year. She was 7th of 13 in a 
Group 3 last time and Godolphin’s mare owns the best 
class ratings in this field. #12 Playlist (4-1) stalked and 
smartly scored in back-to-back turf sprints at Ellis Park 
and Saratoga on June 15 and July 15. The Uncle Mo filly 
got a freshening after that and returned with a clear 
runner-up finish at this distance in a G2 at Kentucky 
Downs Sept. 9. Early-pressing types breaking from 
outside posts can be dangerous down the hill, but I would 
like her more if this race was shorter (both turf sprint wins 
at 5.5f). #3 Honey Pants (8-1) is a competent late running 
turf sprinter for D’Amato. She rallied for the place behind 
her stablemate Elm Drive in the G3 Mizdirection. #13 
Rose Maddox (8-1) is a consistent CA-bred filly exiting a 
sharp local state bred stakes win at this course/distance. 
She will try to get involved from off the pace. #6 Unbridled 



Mary (10-1) stalked, led, and weakened to 3rd late in the 
Swingtime at 8T Oct. 9. That race was a bit too far for her. 
The tactical mare is 2-for-3 with a runner-up finish at 6.5T. 

SA 4 (Golden State Juvenile, CA-bred, 7f)
Primary - #10 LAST CALL LONDON, #11 Magic Spoon
Secondary - #1 Dr. No No, #12 Mici’s Express, #6 Private 
Gem
Wagers: #10 to win, Exacta 10-11/1-10-11, Trifecta 
1-6-10-11/1-6-10-11/12, Superfecta key 10/1-6-11-12

$1 Pick 6 (races 4-9): 
1-10-11-12/1-2-4/7/6-9-11-12/10/2-8 ($96)

Comments: #10 Last Call London (4-1) fired trifecta 
shots in 5 of 6 starts. He stalked and smartly graduated in 
a local 5f MSW sprint June 11, and lost all chance after 
stumbling at the start in his next stakes start at 
Pleasanton. He returned to SoCal and rallied to miss by a 
head in the Graduation Aug. 11, and he battled on the 
pace and was a close 3rd in the I’m Smokin Sept. 8. He 
ran well all five times Hernandez was aboard and this is 
his first start as a gelding. #11 Magic Spoon (6-1) had 
early trouble from the inside post and came running for the 
win in a nice local debut victory at 6f Oct. 7. This Good 
Magic colt earned a competitive speed rating in his bow 
and might be this good. #1 Dr. No No (7-2) stalked the 
pace from post 10 and finished a length behind Mici’s 
Express in his bow. He stalked and aired as the favorite 
second time out, and stalked from the outside post and 
edged Mici’s Express and Last Call London in the I’m 
Smokin last time. He will have to work out a different trip 



from the inside post after breaking outside in his first three 
starts. #12 Mici’s Express (5-1) was overmatched in the 
G3 Zuma Beach at 8T Oct. 8. He moved forward in his 
maiden win at DMR July 22, and was a close 3rd in the 
Graduation and missed by a nose in the I’m Smokin. 
Rosario hops aboard the late running threat. #6 Private 
Gem (8-1) rallied to score by a nose in his local CA-bred 
Mcl-50k bow at 5.5f under apprentice Torrealba Oct. 20. 
Mark Glatt claimed the Lookin At Lucky colt from Carla 
Gaines and Flavien Prat is his new pilot. 

SA 5 (BC Juvenile Turf Sprint, 5T) 
Primary - #2 NO NAY METS, #1 Crimson Advocate
Secondary - #4 Big Evs, #9 Amidst Waves, #12 
Committee of One, #6 Starlust
Wagers: #2 to win, Exacta box 1-2, Trifecta 
1-2-4/1-2-4-6-9-12/1-2-4-6-9-12, Superfecta 
1-2-4-6/1-2-4-6/9-12/9-12

$3 BC Friday All-Turf Pick 3 (races 5, 7, 9): 
1-2-4/6-9-11-12/2-8 ($72)

50 cent BC Friday Pick 5 Ticket (races 5-9): 
1-2-4-6-9-12/7/3-5-6-7-9-11-12-14/10/2-8 ($48) 

Trends: The chart below shows all five winners of the BC 
Juvenile Turf Sprint. Wesley Ward is the trainer to watch in 
the Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Turf Sprint. He won this race 
with Four Wheel Drive in 2019, Golden Pal in 2020, and 
filly Twilight Gleaming in 2021, and was second with filly 
Chelsea Cloisters in 2018. Irad Ortiz Jr. booted home all 
three of Ward’s Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Turf Sprint 



winners. Overseas invader Mischief Magic (IRE) won the 
BC Juvenile Turf Sprint race in 2022 for Charles Appleby 
and Godolphin. Jockey William Buick guided him home, 
and he was exiting a fourth at Newmarket. Dramatised 
(IRE), a filly shipping from York, completed the exacta, 
and Private Creed finished third for trainer Steve 
Asmussen. Love Reigns (IRE) was the beaten favorite for 
Wesley Ward. The Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Turf Sprint was 
previously held at Santa Anita in 2019. The 
aforementioned Four Wheel Drive was the winner, and the 
son of American Pharoah was exiting a victory in the 
Futurity (G3) at Belmont Park. The BC Juvenile Turf Sprint 
was a race for the U.S.-based runners prior to last year. 
Wesley Ward is the exception. He  is known for sending 
some of his better early season juveniles to Ascot in the 
spring, and he did just that with two of his winners 
(Twilight Gleaming, Golden Pal). It almost seems 
impossible that there were 24 pre-entries in this race and 
none are trained by Ward. 

Last 3 Winners: Overseas invader Mischief Magic (IRE) 
won the BC Juvenile Turf Sprint race in 2022 for Charles 
Appleby and Godolphin. It was Twilight Gleaming in 2021 
and Golden Pal in 2020, and both were Ortiz Jr./Ward. 



Jockeys to Watch: Irad Ortiz Jr. (see Trends above).

Trainers to Watch: Wesley Ward (see Trends above).

BC Juvenile Turf Sprint Horse Comments:

#1 Crimson Advocate (4-1) was a clear third behind 
Brightwork in her dirt sprint bow. She added blinkers and 
graduated in a turf sprint stakes second time out, and 
shipped to Ascot and won the 26-horse G2 Queen Mary 
by a nose. Relief Rally was the runner-up that day and she 
won her last two starts including the G2 Lowther at York 
Aug. 24. She is fast early for George Weaver and is one of 
the top contenders in this race. 

#2 No Nay Mets (4-1) is a talented turf sprinter for George 
Weaver. He cruised from start to finish in his winning turf 
sprint stakes debut. He went to Ascot and finished 9th of 
14 in the G2 Norfolk second time out. He returned to the 
states and wired the field in the Tyro July 30, and the 2-3 
finishers were next-out winners. He easily scored again as 
the chalk in the Rosie’s at Colonial Downs Sept. 9, and the 
show finisher was a next-out stakes winner. He drilled a 
turf bullet for this on the Saratoga training turf Oct. 20. Irad 
Ortiz Jr. hops aboard the filly for the first time.  

#3 Tiger Belle (15-1) is 3-for-5 with a runner-up finish and 
all five races were at 5T. Two wins were in Ireland, and 
she shipped to France and captured a G3 Aug. 31, and 
runner-up Dawn Charger won the G3 Prix Eclipse Sept. 16 
and was 2nd in the G2 Criterium de Maisons Laffitte Oct. 
7. She is one of the more interesting overseas shippers. 



#4 Big Evs (3-1) won a Group 3 race in GB in August. He 
was nowhere in his next Group 1 start, and bounced back 
with a Group 2 score at Doncaster Sept. 15. His overseas 
turf sprint form is not bad, and if an invader fires in this 
spot, he might be the one. 

#5 Givemethebeatboys (15-1) was an early bloomer in 
Ireland with back-to-back turf sprint wins in May including 
a G3 score at the Curragh. He was 4th, 3rd, and 4th in his 
last three turf sprint stakes starts and others seem more 
appealing. 

#6 Starlust (20-1) misfired in his bow, was part of the 
exacta in his next five starts (3 wins), and was 5th of 9 at 
22-1 in a G1 at Newmarket last time. The G3 winner is 
probably not good enough to win but Dettori should give 
him every chance to succeed.  

#7 Shards (15-1) ran well in all four starts. He broke his 
maiden in a turf sprint at Colonial Downs Sept. 7 and was 
a close 3rd in the Indian Summer last time. He is getting 
better. 

#8 Cherry Blossom (12-1) had it going on in July and 
August with a win and a pair of runner-up finishes. She 
placed in a Group 2 Aug. 24 and exits an okay 4th of 11 in 
the G1 Cheveley Park at Newmarket. She probably wants 
a bit more real estate to work with. 

#9 Amidst Waves (8-1) fired in all four turf sprints. She 
graduated second time out and won the Colleen and 



Bolton Landing in her next two starts. She rallied to miss 
by a nose in the Indian Summer last time. She was the 
favorite in her last three starts and continues to get faster. 

#10 Valiant Force (12-1) was 2nd in his bow and finished 
5th behind Givemethebeatboys (IRE) second time out. He 
picked up a stunning win at 150-1 in the G2 Norfolk, and 
was 5th of 9 in the G1 Prix Mornay Aug. 20. He must 
prove that his lone win was for real.    

#11 Slider (8-1) is faster on dirt. He set the pace and was 
clearly second best in his bow, and chased from second 
and pulled clear in a fast dirt sprint second time out. He 
switched to turf and won the Speakeasy as the favorite 
Oct. 7 but his speed rating dipped. I would like him more if 
this was the Juvenile Dirt Sprint.    

#12 Committee of One (8-1) was my top choice over 
Amidst Waves in the Indian Summer and he got up by a 
nose at 7-1. Asmussen’s Mendelssohn colt is getting 
faster but he might run out of ground at this abbreviated 
trip. 

AE #13 Hedwig (20-1) stalked and scored over Committee 
of One in his 5.5T bow and the show finisher was a next-
out winner. He chased from 2nd, led, and was second 
best as the beaten favorite in a turf sprint stakes at KD last 
time. Rispoli will ride if he gets in. 

AE #14 Asean (20-1) needs two defections to get in and 
this would be his first start beyond 5T. He is also entered 
in Friday’s Golden Mile at SA (see race 1).



AE #15 April Vintage (20-1) would be hung out in a tough 
post if she made in into the field. She graduated at 5T 
Sept. 1 and was 3rd in the Speakeasy last time. 

SA 6 (BC Juvenile Fillies, 8.5f) 
Primary - #7 TAMARA
Secondary - #12 Just F Y I, #1 Candied, #11 Life Talk, 
#10 Accommodate Eva
Wagers: Exacta box 7-12, Trifecta key 7/1-12, 
Superfecta key 7/1-11-12, Super High 5 key 
7/1-10-11-12

50 cent BC Friday Pick 4 (races 6-9): 
7/3-5-6-7-9-11-12-14/10/2-5-7-8-12-14 ($24)
50 cent BC Friday Pick 4 (races 6-9): 
7/6-9-11-12/2-4-6-10/2-8 ($16)
50 cent BC Friday Pick 4 (races 6-9): 
1-7-12/6-9-11-12/10/2-8 ($12) 

Trends: The Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Fillies has been held 
at Santa Anita ten times (see chart below). Brave Raj was 
the first winner at the Great Race Place in 1986. Phone 
Chatter (1993), Halfbridled (2003), Stardom Bound (2008), 
She Be Wild (2009), Beholder (2012), Ria Antonia (2013), 
Take Charge Brandi (2014), Champagne Room (2016), 
and British Idiom (2019) also won this race at Santa Anita 
Park. The Oak Leaf shows up three times, and that Santa 
Anita race has been renamed the Chandelier. Five of the 
ten winners had their final prep at Santa Anita including 
champion Beholder, dam of 2023 BC Juvenile Fillies 
favorite Tamara. Early speed can be dangerous in this 



race, and watch out for horses exiting a good effort in the 
Frizette.  

Last 3 Winners: Wonder Wheel rallied from the back of 
the pack to win this race in 2022 for Tyler Gaffalione and 
Mark Casse. She paid $15 and was exiting a front running 
victory in the Grade 1 Alcibiades. Echo Zulu did not 
disappoint as the chalk in the 2021 renewal of the 
Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Fillies for Steve Asmussen. She 
was 3-for-3 heading into this event including back-to-back 
Grade 1 wins in the Spinaway and Frizette. Vequist was 
the 2020 winner at Keeneland and she was first in the 
Spinaway (G1) and second in the Frizette (G1) prior to the 
Breeders’ Cup. 

Jockeys to Watch: Javier Castellano guided home two 
winners at Santa Anita (British Idiom, Ria Antonia). Joel 
Rosario has booted home the winner of this race in three 
of the last five years (Echo Zulu, Jaywalk, Vequist). Mike 
Smith rode the winner of the Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Fillies 
three times (Caledonia Road, Songbird, Stardom Bound). 
John Velazquez piloted a pair of winners in this race 
(Caressing, Storm Flag Flying). 



Trainers to Watch: Steve Asmussen saddled My Miss 
Aurelia to victory in 2011, and he struck again with Echo 
Zulu in 2021. Bob Baffert has surprisingly only won this 
race twice (Indian Blessing, Silverbulletday). D. Wayne 
Lukas is still very much active in this game, and he 
saddled the winner of this race a record six times including 
Take Charge Brandi at Santa Anita in 2014. Richard 
Mandella saddled the winner of this race three times at 
Santa Anita (Beholder, Halfbridled, Phone Chatter), and 
he has morning line favorite Tamara in 2023. 

BC Juvenile Fillies Horse Comments: 

#1 Candied (4-1) was a professional winner from off the 
pace in her 6f bow at the Spa. She stretched out in the G1 
Alcibiades second time out and ran down experienced 
stakes winner V V’s Dream to win by a length. Pletcher’s 
Candy Ride filly should save ground behind the speed and 
is a logical top three candidate. 

#2 Jody’s Pride (15-1) aired by 10 lengths in a race 
originally scheduled for turf and run at 5.5f on a good track 
in her SAR bow Aug. 9. She ran in the Matron Stakes 
second time out and that race was also moved to dirt, and 
she stalked and scored by 3 1/4 lengths. She earned a 
better speed rating last time but her trainer struggles with 
his graded stakes starters. 

#3 Scalable (20-1) is still a maiden for Pletcher. She split a 
10-horse field from the outside post in her bow and was a 
solid 2nd in the G2 Chandelier last time. That Chandelier 



had multiple maidens signed on and this is a much deeper 
cast. 

#4 Where’s My Ring (30-1) is still a maiden after three 
starts. She stalked, led, and missed by a nose in her 5.5f 
bow, and stalked, led, and finished a close 3rd on a good 
track at 6.5f second time out. She was 4th of 9 in the G3 
Surfer Girl at 8T last time. She needs an easier spot. 

#5 Omaha Girl (30-1) is a $400k Omaha Beach filly with a 
2-for-3 record. She is 2-for-2 on dirt and exits a front 
running stakes win in the Hallandale Beach at one mile. 
She is not nearly fast enough. 

#6 Chatalas (8-1) stalked outside and gamely graduated 
by a half-length in her 5.5f bow at DMR. She chased the 
pace and was no match for Tamara in the G1 Del Mar 
Debutante second time out, and stretched out and wired 
the field from the inside post as my top choice in the G2 
Chandelier last time. I thought that last race was weak but 
she did flatter Tamara. 

#7 Tamara (4-5) is going to win this if she handles two 
turns. She stalked and scored from the intimidating inside 
post in her 6.5f bow at DMR, and sailed away from her 
rivals in a 6 3/4 length tally in the G1 Del Mar Debutante. 
They purposely kept her out of the G2 Chandelier so she 
would be fresher for this. Her dam Beholder won this race, 
jockey Mike Smith has three wins, and trainer Richard 
Mandella has three BC Juvenile Fillies wins at SA 
including Beholder. 



#8 Espirit Enchante (20-1) spilt a 10-horse field in her bow 
and winner Sandy Bottom scored again in the Anoakia 
Oct. 21. This $250k Tapit filly stalked and graduated by a 
nose at 6.5f on a good local track Oct. 1. She drilled a 6f 
bullet for this Oct. 21 and has potential, but not in this 
race. 

#9 Brightwork (12-1) was zipping right along in dirt sprints 
earlier this year. She is 4-for-4 sprinting on dirt including 
wins in the Debutante, Adirondack (G3), and Spinaway 
(G1). She failed to handle two turns in a fading 5th of 8 in 
the Alcibiades last time. She appears best around one 
turn. 

#10 Accommodate Eva (20-1) added blinkers and jumped 
up with a vastly improved effort in an extended sprint 
maiden win Oct. 12. The pace was slow that day and she 
had control of the race throughout. This two turn G1 will 
have much livelier fractions but I will use her underneath 
at long odds. 

#11 Life Talk (20-1) is a $335k Gun Runner filly for 
Pletcher. Alys Beach beat her by a head in her bow and 
she returned to romp at one mile as the strong favorite 
second time out. She ended up an okay 3rd in the G1 
Frizette last time and should handle two turns. 

#12 Just F Y I (8-1) is interesting for Bill Mott. The 6f 
distance was probably too short for her in her bow but she 
stalked and scored by a head. She competed in the G1 
Frizette in the slop at one mile October. 7, and she stalked 
and was clearly best by 3 3/4 lengths. Her pedigree 



screams two turns (Justify - Star Act, by Street Cry) and 
her best races should be in front of her. She might win this 
if Tamara stubs her toe. 

#13 Alys Beach (30-1) stalked the pace and beat Life Talk 
by a head in her dirt sprint bow at Saratoga. She was 
outrun early and passed a few rivals in the G1 Spinaway 
Sept. 3, and Brightwork and Ways and Means dominated 
that race. She set the pace from the inside post and just 
held the show in the G1 Alcibiades last time. She is not 
fast enough. 

SA 7 (BC Juvenile Fillies Turf, 8T)
Primary - #12 HARD TO JUSTIFY, #9 Carla’s Way
Secondary - #6 Porta Fortuna, #11 She Feels Pretty, #3 
Buchu, #7 Gala Brand, #5 Content, #14 Les Pavots
Wagers: #12 to win, Exacta box 9-12, Trifecta 
6-9-11-12/6-9-11-12/3-6-7-9-11-12, Superfecta 
6-9-12/3-5-6-7-9-11-12-14/3-7-11/3-7-11

50 cent Pick 4 (races 7-10): 
3-5-6-7-9-11-12-14/10/2/2-3-4 ($12) 
50 cent Pick 4 (races 7-10): 3-5-6-9-11-12/10/2-5-8/2-4 
($18)
50 cent Pick 4 (races 7-10): 3-6-9-11-12/2-4-6-10/2/2-3-4 
($30)

Trends: The chart below shows all seven BC Juvenile 
Fillies Turf winners at SA. Chad Brown saddled the winner 
at SA three times and each captured the Miss Grillo in 
their final BC prep. The 2023 Miss Grillo was run at 
Aqueduct on 10-4-23, and Chad Brown trainee Hard to 



Justify won that race. Horses exiting a prep in this country 
captured this race 9 times. Three overseas runners scored 
including Meditate (IRE) last year, and Woodbine shippers 
tallied three times.  It looks like Newmarket is the main 
racecourse to look for when considering overseas runners.    

Last 3 Winners: Last year’s Breeders’ Cup Juvenile 
Fillies Turf winner Meditate (IRE) rallied from 10th place to 
win this race by 2 1/2 lengths as the favorite for Ryan 
Moore and Aidan O’Brien. Miss Grillo (G2) winner 
Pleasant Passage was second best and Woodbine 
shipper Cairo Consort picked up the show at 19-1. 2021 
Juvenile Fillies Turf winner Pizza Bianca was exiting a 
runner-up finish in the Natalma (G1) at Woodbine. 
Jessamine (G2) winner Aunt Pearl won this event at 
Keeneland in 2020 for Brad Cox and Florent Geroux.

Jockeys to Watch: Three riders have won this race twice 
(Javier Castellano, Florent Geroux, Irad Ortiz Jr). 

Trainers to Watch: Chad Brown has had tremendous 
success in the Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Fillies Turf. Maram 
(2008), Lady Eli (2014), New Money Honey (2016), and 
Newspaperofrecord (2018) pulled off the Miss Grillo/BC 
Juvenile Fillies Turf double for Brown, who also saddled 



Rushing Fall to victory in this race in 2017 at Del Mar. The 
latter did not prep in the Miss Grillo. She exited a win in 
the Jessamine at Keeneland.   

BC Juvenile Fillies Turf Horse Comments: 

#1 Buttercream Babe (30-1) was solid in all three turf 
sprints. She battled on the pace and won by 1 3/4 lengths 
in her 6.5T bow, and closed, led, and held 3rd in the 
Untapable second time out. She missed by a neck in the 
G3 Surfer Girl last time and the slow pace and slow race 
helped her cause. She might impact the pace. 

#2 Flattery (20-1) rallied from off the pace to win her first 
two 8T starts including the Juvenile Fillies Turf at DMR 
Sept. 9. She was an even 3rd in the local G3 Surfer Girl 
Oct. 8 and her number dropped that day. I like this filly but 
not in this race. 

#3 Buchu (6-1) is improving rapidly for Phil Bauer. She 
stalked and smartly graduated at 8.5T Sept. 23 and 
earned a quality late pace rating. That was her fourth 
career starts, and she proved that one was for real when 
she clicked in the G2 Jessamine at KEE Oct. 6. She won 
her last two turf starts at this distance by a combined 8 1/2 
lengths and the Justify filly can be competitive in this spot. 

#4 Laulne (15-1) is an overseas transplant now 
conditioned by D’Amato. She fired in all six turf sprints in 
France. She won a G3 at 7T in July and hit the board in 
her last two starts vs. G2 and G3 company including a 
neck defeat Sept. 16. They paid $793k for this one in 2023 



and she is bred to handle this distance. 

#5 Content (15-1) exits a decent G3 win at the Curragh for 
Aidan O’Brien and she was 20-1 in that 10-horse 8T affair. 
The daughter of Galileo has the look of a filly on the 
improve. 

#6 Porta Fortuna (5-1) might be a contender in this spot 
for Donnacha O’Brien. She is 4-for-6 with two minor 
awards. She won a pair of G3 races earlier this year and 
exits a victory in the G1 Cheveley Park at 6T Sept. 30. 
Can she handle the added ground of this race? 

#7 Gala Brand (12-1) made up an amazing 14 lengths in 
the final furlong and a half in her winning 5.5T bow and 
runner-up Hidden Class was a next-out winner. She 
stretched out and beat the boys in the G3 With 
Anticipation Aug. 31 and runner-up Carson’s Run won the 
G1 Summer in his next start. Bill Mott’s filly was the 
favorite in the G2 Miss Grillo Oct. 4 and she ran 4th in a 
race that did to set up for her. She packs a nice late kick 
and can be played in this race. 

#8 Life’s an Audible (15-1) switched to turf and graduated 
at 5 1/2 furlongs second time out, and stretched out and 
was 2nd in the G2 Miss Grillo last time. She needs to 
continue to improve if she expects to threaten these. 

#9 Carla’s Way (6-1) won her 6.5T bow in GB at 5-2 odds 
and the runner-up was a next out winner. She was 8th of 
17 in the G3 Albany second time out and Porta Fortuna 
handled her in that race. She was 2nd in a G2 at 7T Aug. 



26. Darnation won the latter race and scored again in the 
G2 May Hill Sept. 14. This filly exits a 7T score vs. G2 
rivals at Newmarket. She beat Ylang Ylang (GB) last time 
and that one returned to capture the G1 Fillies Mile at 
Newmarket Oct. 13. The $437k Starspangledbanner filly 
has good company lines. 

#10 Austere (12-1) won both turf routes for Brendan 
Walsh. She stalked and scored from post 11 in her 8.5T 
bow at Ellis Park, and stalked and kicked away in a $500k 
8T stakes at KD last time. She will need to run much faster 
to threaten these. 

#11 She Feels Pretty (4-1) rallied to win her 5.5T bow by a 
neck July 16. She was flying late in that race, and she 
stretched out and rolled home to a 4 1/4 length victory in 
the G1 Natalma at 8T second time out. Natalma runner-up 
Simply in Front returned to graduate in an all-weather 
route Oct. 7. Cherie DeVaux is a sharp trainer and I 
consider this filly a contender.  

#12 Hard to Justify (6-1) sat in midpack and came running 
for the win at 3-1 odds in the turf route bow. She was 7-1 
in the G2 Miss Grillo last time and sat outside in 2nd and 
won by a measured half-length. Watch out for Chad 
Brown’s Miss Grillo winners in the BC Juvenile Fillies Turf. 
They are usually live. 

#13 Dreamfyre (15-1) was too fleet for her rivals in back-
to-back dirt sprint stakes wins to begin her career. She 
was blitzing through 21 and change fractions in those 
races, and she stretched out and switched to turf in the 



Surfer Girl (G3) last time. She was the favorite there but I 
was not sure about the added ground or surface switch, 
but she battled though slow fractions and gamely 
prevailed by a neck in a slow race. She should be 
forwardly placed.  

#14 Les Pavots (8-1) finished in the top three in all six 
starts in France. She won a G2 at 7T on heavy ground 
Aug. 19 and was 3rd of 10 in a flat mile G1 at Longchamp 
Oct. 1. She will have to overcome a tough post and must 
prove that she can handle firm footing. 

AE #15 Go With Gusto (15-1) rallied from post 10 to cross 
the line 1st in her 8T bow at WO but was placed 5th 
through disqualification. She was along for the show in the 
G1 Summer second time out and runner-up My Boy 
Prince was a next-out stakes winner in the Cup and 
Saucer. Mark Casse’s Medaglia d’Oro maiden will try to 
get involved from off the pace.  

AE #16 Mo Fox Given (30-1) stalked the pace and pulled 
off a 49-1 upset in her turf route bow at Colonial. She 
rallied from last to miss by a head at CD second time out. 
Powell has her now and she will try to get involved late. 
She improved her number last time but she seems 
overmatched. 

SA 8 (BC Juvenile, 8.5f) - SA Best Bet
Primary - #10 MUTH, #2 Prince of Monaco
Secondary - #4 Timberlake, #6 Locked, #3 Wine Me Up, 
#9 Fierceness
Wagers: #10 to win, Exacta box 2-10, Trifecta 



2-4-6-10/2-4-6-10/1-3, Superfecta 
10/2-4-6/1-2-3-4-6-8-9/1-2-3-4-6-8-9
Super High Five key 10/2-3-4-6

Special 2-Day Double (Fri-SA 8, Sat-SA 9): 10-12

Trends: This event has been held at Santa Anita ten 
times (see chart below). Capote was the first winner at the 
Great Race Place in 1986. Brocco (1993), Action This Day 
(2003), Midshipman (2008), Vale of York (2009), Shanghai 
Bobby (2012), New Year’s Day (2013), Texas Red (2014), 
Classic Empire (2016), and Storm the Court (2019) also 
won this race at Santa Anita Park. Four of the SA winners 
exited the Norfolk, FrontRunner, and American Pharoah, 
and they are all the same race at Santa Anita Park. It was 
run as the Norfolk from 1970-2011. They changed the 
name to FrontRunner from 2012-2017, and it started 
running as the American Pharoah Stakes in 2018. Horses 
with two turn experience captured the Breeders’ Cup 
Juvenile in 9 of the last 10 years. 2013-16 BC Juvenile 
heroes, plus 2018-22 winners all had two turn experience, 
and eight of those winners scored in two turn races prior to 
the BC. Good Magic was the lone recent exception. He 
was a maiden with two starts heading into the BC, and 
was exiting a runner-up finish in the Champagne (G1), a 
one-turn mile.  



Last 3 Winners: Forte won this race last year at 5-1 odds 
while stalking the pace from midpack. He was exiting a 
win in the Breeders’ Futurity (G1), so he pulled off a Grade 
1 double at Keeneland. 2021 BC Juvenile hero Corniche 
won his first two starts including the American Pharoah 
(G1) at Santa Anita. Essential Quality also pulled off the 
Breeders’ Futurity/BC Juvenile double at Keeneland in 
2020. 

Jockeys to Watch: The only active rider with more than 
one BC Juvenile win is Mike Smith. He booted home the 
winner of this race three times (Unbridled’s Song, 
Vindication, Corniche). 

Trainers to Watch: Bob Baffert and D. Wayne Lukas both 
saddled the winner of the BC Juvenile five times. Todd 
Pletcher won the BC Juvenile with Uncle Mo (2010), 
Shanghai Bobby (2012), and Forte (2022). Doug O’Neill 
saddled two winners (Stevie Wonderboy, Nyquist). 

BC Juvenile Horse Comments: 



#1 The Wine Steward (8-1) is a NY-bred son of BC 
Classic winner Vino Rosso. He stalked and scored in his 
first three sprints and two of those were stakes races. He 
worked out a nice stalking trip from the inside post in the 
Breeders’ Futurity, but Locked was better despite covering 
much more ground. I do not have anything bad to say 
about this $340k purchase, but he is probably a cut below 
the top contenders. Another inside stalking trip would help 
his cause. 

#2 Prince of Monaco (4-1) has done nothing wrong for 
Baffert. The $950k Speightstown colt dueled early and 
won for fun in his LRC bow. He sat behind strong fractions 
and went right on by his stablemate Muth in the Best Pal 
(G3), and he clicked right back in the Del Mar Futurity 
(G1). Most of the recent winners of this race had two turn 
experience so he has that to overcome, but he is clearly 
talented enough to win this. 

#3 Wine Me Up (15-1) is a $300k son of Vino Rosso and 
he is fast early. He dueled inside and won his debut by 1 
1/2 lengths. He stretched out in the American Pharoah 
and set the pace and was no match for his stablemate 
Muth in a clear runner-up finish. He should impact the 
pace in this race. 

#4 Timberlake (4-1) is one of the Big 4 Grade 1 winners. 
The $340k Into Mischief colt broke slow and flopped as 
the chalk in his bow and that was a productive race. He 
added blinkers and crushed a pair of next-out winners 
second time out. I made him my top choice in the Hopeful 
(G1), and the pace was strong and he was running up on 



heels, and he had to settle for the place behind shocking 
late runner Nutella Fella. He was almost 5-1 in the 
Champagne (G1) Oct. 7, and he removed blinkers, rated 
behind the pace, and pulled well clear to score by 4 1/4 
lengths in the slop. He has yet to go two turns but sure 
acts like he will handle added ground. 

#5 Ecoro Neo (30-1) - SCRATCHED.

#6 Locked (7-2) is one of the more likely winners of this 
race. He showed nice late interest after an uncomfortable 
start in his sprint bow. He got more ground and a better 
start at 8f Sept. 1, and he pressed the pace and dusted 
next-out winner Drum Roll Please. In the Breeders’ 
Futurity (G1) Oct. 7, he raced wide throughout from the 
outside post and gamely wore down inside stalker The 
Wine Steward. Pletcher won this race in 2022 with 
Breeders’ Futurity hero Forte. 

#7 Cuban Thunder (30-1) was sharp in overseas turf 
sprints in April and May. He went off form after that and 
has lost his last four starts by a combined 63 1/4 lengths. 

#8 General Partner (8-1) made an easy lead and cruised 
second time out. He was able to set the pace in the 
Champagne after Fierceness blew the break, and he was 
clearly second best behind Timberlake. I do not see him 
getting an easy lead this time. 

Which #9 Fierceness (6-1) will show up? Will it be the 
romping debut version or the up the track Champagne 
runner? Was that the same horse last time? He was 



outstanding in his bow and that was a productive race, 
and he lunged at the start and was nowhere last out. He 
needs an alert beginning and a clear early lead, but Wine 
Me Up wants the front end as well. 

#10 Muth (4-1) is a $2 million Good Magic colt and his sire 
won the BC Juvenile in 2017. He romped in his sprint bow 
and was too eager chasing strong fractions second time 
out. He stretched out in the American Pharaoh (G1) and 
everyone was wondering if he could ration his 21 and 
change speed. The answer was a resounding yes. He 
stalked kindly from an inner post, took over, and kicked 
away from his front running stablemate Wine Me Up. He 
could easily become Baffert’s sixth winner of this race. 

#11 Noted (20-1) ran well in all four starts. He graduated 
in a turf route and switched to dirt and won the Sapling. He 
was back on turf for the Bourbon (G2) last time, and he 
rallied late to miss by a nose. He is a decent sort but is not 
fast enough to win this race.  

SA 9 (BC Juvenile Turf, 8T) - SA Best Bet
Primary - #2 RIVER TABER, #8 Unquestionable
Secondary - #5 My Boy Prince, #7 Agate Road, #12 
Mountain Bear, #14 Carson’s Run
Wagers: #2 to win, Exacta box 2-8, Trifecta 
2-5-8/2-5-7-8-12-14/2-5-7-8-12-14, Superfecta 
2-8/2-5-7-8/2-3-4-5-7-8-12-14/2-3-4-5-7-8-12-14

Trends: This is still a relatively new BC event (first held in 
2007). The Juvenile Turf has been run at Santa Anita 
seven times (see chart below). At SA, the winner of this 



race prepped overseas five times, and the other two SA 
winners were exiting victories in the Pilgrim. Overseas 
runners have won the Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Turf 11 
times in 16 years. 2014 winner Hootenanny started his 
career in this country, but his final two preps before the 
Juvenile Turf were at Ascot and Deauville, so I am 
counting him as an overseas winner. The Pilgrim Stakes in 
New York is a key race for the U.S. runners. Fire At Will, 
Structor, Oscar Performance each pulled off the Pilgrim/
BC Juvenile Turf double. 

Last 3 Winners: Last year’s Breeders’ Cup Juvenile Turf 
winner Victoria Road (IRE) sat in midpack and nipped post 
time favorite Silver Knott (GB) by a nose. Ryan Moore 
rode the winner for Aidan O’Brien and he paid $13.14. 
Nagirroc landed the show at 39-1 and Mo Stash was 
fourth at 51-1, and those two runners blew up the 
superfecta. Modern Games (IRE) took this event in 2021. 
He was mistakenly scratched due to a gate snafu and was 
reinstated by the stewards, but he ran for purse money 
only. William Buick guided him home for Charles Appleby. 
Pilgrim winners Fire At Will (2020) and Structor (2019) 
both captured the BC Juvenile Turf for the U.S. team.  



Jockeys to Watch: Ryan Moore booted home the BC 
Juvenile Turf winner five times (Wrote, George Vancouver, 
Hit It a Bomb, Mendelssohn, Victoria Road). 
Frankie Dettori pulled off the hat trick in this race, and 
William Buick and Jose Ortiz both won this event twice. 

Trainers to Watch: Aidan O’Brien has won this race five 
times and Ryan Moore was aboard each of those 
winners. Charles Appleby struck in 2013, 2018, and 2021 
(Outstrip, Line of Duty, Modern Games), and William Buick 
rode the latter pair. John Gosden saddled the winner of 
this race in 2008 and 2009 at Santa Anita, and Frankie 
Dettori rode both.

BC Juvenile Turf Horse Comments:

#1 Air Recruit (20-1) stalked and scored in his 5.5T bow, 
and was 3rd behind No Nay Mets in the Rosie’s at 5.5T 
second time out. He stretched out and cruised in the 
Laurel Futurity last time. He is not fast enough to threaten 
these. 

#2 River Taber (3-1) brings consistent overseas turf sprint 
form to the table for Aidan O’Brien. He won his first three 
starts including the G2 Coventry, and was 3rd in his last 
two G1 starts. He is not out of this if he handles the added 
ground of this race, and O’Brien’s main rider Ryan Moore 
opted for this one.  

#3 Tok Tok (20-1) won his first two turf starts at Colonial 
including the Kitten’s Joy. He tried tougher company in the 



G2 Bourbon and ended up 5th of 12. Motion’s colt earned 
okay late pace ratings in his last two starts. 

#4 Can Group (12-1) completed the trifecta in his first two 
dirt sprints and Timberlake beat him second time out. He 
switched to turf and graduated at 7T Sept. 2 and stretched 
out and went last-to-first in the 12-horse G2 Bourbon at 
27-1 odds Oct. 8. He is getting faster and earned a strong 
late pace rating last time. I can see him landing a share in 
this spot.

#5 My Boy Prince (8-1) finished 1-2 in all five starts for 
Mark Casse. He set the pace in his last four starts and 
comfortably won three of those races. He was 2nd in the 
G1 Summer and dominated restricted stakes foes in the 
Cup and Saucer last time. He should impact the pace and 
might be the main speed.  

#6 Stay Hot (20-1) switched to turf and stretched out after 
two dirt sprints, and he looked sharp in his local 8T 
maiden win Oct. 7. I think there is something here but he 
is not ready for this type of company.  

#7 Agate Road (8-1) packs a nice late kick for Pletcher. 
He flew late to miss by a nose in a race originally 
scheduled for turf and run at one mile on dirt at SAR Aug. 
5. He got no pack help and closed powerfully to graduate 
at 8.5T second time out. The $650k Quality Road colt 
finished full of run to win the G2 Pilgrim Oct. 4 and that 
race has proven to be a strong prep for the BC Juvenile 
Turf. His number dipped last time and I am not sure he is 
fast enough to win this. 



#8 Unquestionable (4-1) might be the right one for Aidan 
O’Brien. He was competitive in all five starts but only 
scored once. His victory was a sharp 6T score May 27 and 
he missed by a head in a G2 July 2. He missed 3rd by a 
head in a G1 at 6T Aug. 12, and showed improvement in a 
runner-up finish in a G1 at 7T Oct. 1. Dettori rides this one.  

#9 Endlessly (5-1) won all three flat mile turf starts from off 
the pace. He captured the G3 Del Mar Juvenile Turf Sept. 
10 and took the G3 Zuma Beach at SA Oct. 8. He 
improved his speed ratings in all three starts and can 
make some noise in the lane. 

#10 Fulmineo (20-1) hooked subsequent G1 Hopeful hero 
Nutella Fella in his dirt sprint bow, and stretched out and 
graduated in a turf route second time out. He was along 
for the place in the G2 Pilgrim last time, and Agate Road is 
the one I want out of that race. 

#11 Liam’s Journey - SCRATCHED.

#12 Mountain Bear (12-1) was 3rd in a G2 Aug. 1. He is 2-
for-7 overall and exits an all-weather extended sprint win 
in a 14-horse field Oct. 6. Aidan O’Brien has some better 
runners in this race but he is not completely out of this. 

#13 Grand Mo the First (20-1) won his first two all-weather 
sprints at GP. He shipped to SA and finished an okay 3rd 
in G3 Zuma Beach last time. The Uncle Mo colt is over his 
head in this spot. 



#14 Carson’s Run (6-1) rallied to earn his diploma by a 
neck over next-out winner Moonlight in his turf route bow 
at SAR. He stalked and finished a half-length behind Gala 
Brand in the G3 With Anticipation, and he strongly went 
last-to-first in the G1 Summer last time. Christophe 
Clement’s colt has some ability but the post is tough. 

SA 10 (OC-50k/1x, 6f) 
Primary - #2 GHOST OF MIDNIGHT, #3 Hejazi
Secondary - #4 Bus Buzz
Wagers: #2 to win, Exacta 2/3-4, Exacta 3-4/2, Trifecta 
2-3/2-3-4/2-3-4

Comments: #2 Ghost of Midnight (4-1) might be the 
value play. He was excellent from off the pace in his 
winning $20k maiden claiming bow at DMR and the clear 
runner-up was a next-out winner. He stalked and spurted 
away to win by 7 3/4 lengths second time out. He was 8-1 
in his bow and 6-1 second time out, and he earned a 
much better number last time. He reunites with his debut 
pilot Fresu and he might be this good. #3 Hejazi (7-5) 
makes his much anticipated return for Baffert. He was 3rd 
as a maiden in the G1 American Pharoah last year and 
wired the field in a local MSW sprint Jan. 15. He set the 
pace and weakened to 4th in the G2 San Felipe, and 
stalked, battled for the win, and ended up 2nd by a length 
when last seen in the Lafayette at KEE in the spring. 
Baffert and company paid more than $3 million for this 
Bernardini colt and his new rider Hernandez wins races 
with this outfit. #4 Bus Buzz (9-5) is a fleet CA-bred Stay 
Thirsty gelding. He fired exacta shots in all six dirt sprints 
and the real Good Deal winner should be all over the 



pace. 

Rolling Daily Double & Pick 3 Contenders – in order of 
preference:
1   (5-6-4-8)
2   (7-5-6-11)
3   (4-2-12-3-13-6)
4   (10-11-1-12-6)
5   (2-1-4-9-12-6)
6   (7-12-1-11-10)
7   (12-9-6-11-3-7-5-14)
8   (10-2-4-6-3-9)
9   (2-8-5-7-12-14)
10 (2-3-4)

ROLLING DAILY DOUBLE/PICK 3 WAGERING 
STRATEGIES
For Rolling Doubles and Pick 3 tickets, key the top choice 
in each race to all other contenders. See examples below:

Double (Race 1-2): 
Ticket 1 (5-7)
Ticket 2 (5/5-6-7-11)
Ticket 3 (4-5-6-8/7)

Double (Races 2-3):
Ticket 1 (7-4)
Ticket 2 (7/2-3-4-6-12-13)
Ticket 3 (5-6-7-11/4)

Pick 3 (Race 1-3): 
Ticket 1 (5-7-4)



Ticket 2 (5/5-6-7-11/2-3-4-6-12-13)
Ticket 3 (4-5-6-8/7/2-3-4-6-12-13)
Ticket 4 (4-5-6-8/5-6-7-11/4)


